7 Texas State

Bid Tabulation

Solicitation No: 16-PS-019

RFP:

Date Opened:

5/4/2016

Welding Equipment

Technical College.

Alamo Iron Works

Blue Ridge Machinery

Capstone Solutions

Coastal Welding Supply,

Cross Texas Supply

Holmgreen Iron Works

L+R Welding LLC

MarTEk Contractor

Midwest Technologies

Inc.
2771 Robindale Rd. | P.O. Box 536, Putnam Ave 152 Cowan Rd P.O. Box 3029 4009 Ben Ficklin Rd 800 Schneider Road, Suite K-L 2001 VZCR 3701 311 East Saint Elmo Rd. Suit A 2600 Bridgeport Dr.

City, State, Zip Brownsville, TX 78526 Hurricane, WV 25526 Milford, TX 76670 Beaumont,TX 77704 San Angelo, TX 76903 Cibolo,TX 78108 Edgewood,TX 7517 Austin, TX 78745-1249 Sioux City, 1A 51111
Email rgarcia@aiwnet.com pstonestreet@att.net sales@capstonesol.net gsztaba@coastalws.com bjd@crosstexassupply.com |ales@holmgreenironworks.con loverton@ew-title.com marty@martekusa.com bid@midwesttechnology.com
HUB Status No No Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Lincoln Invertec V350-PRO (LIN K1728-13) $16,028.80 | No bid $16,600.00 $15,147.20 $15,819.00 $22,880.00 $27,972.24 $8,911.08 $18,671.88
Plas Torch PCM-200 25° 180D (THE 2-0015) $9,727.25| No Bid $8,750.00 $7,588.50 $8,817.10 $21,450.00 $17,818.75 $8,135.45 $12,993.30
Hydraulic Sheet Metal Shear 220 Volt Three Phase Heavy Duty.
52" length 3 (1/4°*) gauge mild steel capacity.(SH-5203-HD) $25,606.67 $21,985.00 $28,150.00 $32,411.11| No bid $37,953.00 $31,937.50 $24,942.10 $27,554.04
Discount
Shipping ($8,228.30) $3,000.00

TOTAL $51,362.72 $21,985.00 $53,500.00 $55,146.81 $24,636.10 $74,054.70 $80,728.49 $41,988.63 $59,219.22
Total Request Sent 212 PO#| 6036115
Total Received 9 Vendor | Mar-TeK Contractor
Total HUB Sent 115 Price| $24,942.10
Total HUB Received 5
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TECh n Ica| CDI lege ™ Alamo Iron Works Blue Ridge Machinery Capstone Solutions Coastal WT:::mg Supply, Cross Texas Supply Holmgreen Iron Works L+R Welding LLC MarTEk Contractor Midwest Technologies
2771 Robindale Rd. | P.O. Box 536, Putnam Ave 152 Cowan Rd P.O. Box 3029 4009 Ben Ficklin Rd 800 Schneider Road, Suite K-L 2001 VZCR 3701 311 East Saint Elmo Rd. Suit A 2600 Bridgeport Dr.
City, State, Zip Brownsville,TX 78526 Hurricane, WV 25526 Milford, TX 76670 Beaumont,TX 77704 San Angelo, TX 76903 Cibolo,TX 78108 Edgewood,TX 7517 Austin,TX 78745-1249 Sioux City, IA 51111
Email rgarcia@aiwnet.com pstonestreet@att.net sales@capstonesol.net gsztaba@coastalws.com | bjd@crosstexassupply.com Iales@holmgreenironworks.con loverton@ew-title.com marty@martekusa.com bid@midwesttechnology.com
HUB Status No No Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Lincoln Invertec V350-PRO (LIN K1728-13) $16,028.80 | No bid $16,600.00 $15,147.20 $15,819.00 $22,880.00 $27,972.24 $8,911.08 $18,671.88
Plas Torch PCM-200 25° 180D (THE 2-0015) $9,727.25 | No Bid $8,750.00 $7,588.50 $8,817.10 $21,450.00 $17,818.75 $8,135.45 $12,993.30
[Hydraulic Sheet Metal Shear 220 Volt Three Phase Heavy Duty.
52 length 3 (1/4°*) gauge mild steel capacity.(SH-5203-HD) $25,606.67 $21,985.00 $28,150.00 $32,411.11 | No bid $37,953.00 $31,937.50 $24,942.10 $27,554.04
Discount
Shipping ($8,228.30) $3,000.00
TOTAL $51,362.72 $21,985.00 $53,500.00 $55,146.81 $24,636.10 $74,054.70 $80,728.49 $41,988.63 $59,219.22
Item#3 was not accepted by
department. The weight is
11,000 Ibs not 5,000 lbs as
requested.
Total Request Sent 212
Total Received 9
Total HUB Sent 115
Total HUB Received 5
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